
 

TABLE QUIZ 
Team Name:_________________________________________________________________________ 
 

IDENTIFY THE FOLLOWING V’s in SCIENCE: 

No. SCIENTIFIC TERM V WORD 

e.g. A brand name for a drug for men with impotence Viagra 

1 A space in which there is no matter & in which sound cannot be 
heard 

 

2 Thin-walled blood vessel which carries blood from the 
capillaries towards the heart 

 

3 The second planet from the Sun in the solar system  

4 The many finger-like projections that line the wall of the small 
intestine & increase its surface area 

 

5 In biology, the differences between individual members of the 
same species 

 

6 The speed of an object moving in a particular direction  

7 Tiny infectious organism that can replicate inside cells of living 
hosts 

 

8 A space within a plant cell which contains a sap to keep the cell 
firm 

 

9 The SI unit of electric potential  

10 The amount of space taken up by a body or mass in fluids, 
measured in cubic metres 

 

11 One of the lower chambers of the heart that receives blood from 
the atrium & pumps it into arteries 

 

12 Element in the periodic table that has the chemical symbol ‘V’  

13 A physical quantity that has both magnitude & direction, as 
opposed to a scalar quantity 

 

14 A substance administered, often by injection, to stimulate 
antibodies to prevent disease 

 

15 A mass of air or water that spins very fast & pulls objects into 
its empty centre  

 

Your Score =  
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IDENTIFY THE FOLLOWING V’s in SCIENCE: 

No. SCIENTIFIC TERM V WORD 

e.g. A brand name for a drug for men with impotence Viagra 

1 A space in which there is no matter & in which sound cannot be 
heard 

Vacuum 

2 Thin-walled blood vessel which carries blood from the 
capillaries towards the heart 

Vein 

3 The second planet from the Sun in the solar system Venus 

4 The many finger-like projections that line the wall of the small 
intestine & increase its surface area 

Villi 

5 In biology, the differences between individual members of the 
same species 

Variation 

6 The speed of an object moving in a particular direction Velocity 

7 Tiny infectious organism that can replicate inside cells of living 
hosts 

Virus 

8 A space within a plant cell which contains a sap to keep the cell 
firm 

Vacuole 

9 The SI unit of electric potential Volt 

10 The amount of space taken up by a body or mass in fluids, 
measured in cubic metres 

Volume 

11 One of the lower chambers of the heart that receives blood from 
the atrium & pumps it into arteries 

Ventricle 

12 Element in the periodic table that has the chemical symbol ‘V’ Vanadium 

13 A physical quantity that has both magnitude & direction, as 
opposed to a scalar quantity 

Vector 

14 A substance administered, often by injection, to stimulate 
antibodies to prevent disease 

Vaccine 

15 A mass of air or water that spins very fast & pulls objects into 
its empty centre  

Vortex 
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